
4 Hollywood Park çClm25000(25-22.5)
1Â MILES (1:40) CLAIMING. Purse $24,000 For Fillies And Mares Three Years Old And Upward. Three
Year Olds, 120 lbs.; Older, 123 lbs. Non-winners Of A Race At A Mile Or Over Since September 1 Allowed 2 lbs.
Such A Race Since July 1 Allowed 4 lbs. Claiming Price $25,000, if for $22,500, allowed 2 lbs.

1
Red

Susie Joe's
Own: Fjellman or Rader
White, White 'R&a' On Turquoises Ball On

DOUGLAS R R (152 34 23 22 .22) 2004: (1232 231 .19)
$25,000

Dk. b or br f. 4 (May) CALAUG01 $47,000
Sire: Bertrando (Skywalker) $12,500
Dam:Fleet Cozzene (Cozzene)
Br: Ed Nahem (Cal)
Tr: Spawr Bill(20 3 6 2 .15) 2004:(276 63 .23)

L 119

Life 14 3 2 0 $95,08286

2004 3 0 1 0 $7,920 82
2003 10 3 1 0 $87,162 86
Hol 4 1 0 0 $24,060 82

D.Fst 7 2 1 0 $48,540 82
Wet(405) 1 0 1 0 $4,800 82
Turf(357) 6 1 0 0 $41,742 86
Dst(411) 2 1 0 0 $21,180 82

27å04= 2SA wf 6f :21¨ :44§ :56¨1:09§ 3ÎçClm c-(25-22.5) 82 3 3 3¦ 1ô 1ô 2ôGomez G K LB119 9.60 90= 10 Buttertart119ô Susie Joe's119§ Right Direction119¨ Rail bid,led,willingly 6
Claimed from Equils, James W. and Marcia S. for $25,000, Carava Jack Trainer 2004(as of 10/27): ( 277 46 41 36 0.17 )

11á04= 5SA fm 1 ê :23§ :47§ 1:11§1:36¨ 4ÎçÐOC 40k/N1X 66 3 1ô 1Ç 1ô 1Ç 4ªöPedroza M ALB121 8.10 73= 14DeputyTombe119ö ProudNicole119§ElectricChir117¨ Inside duel,weakened 8
16â04= 6SA fm 1 ê :22© :46¦ 1:10§1:34© 4ÎçAlw 56000N1X - 4 4¨ 4§ 5¨ 10¦© -Smith M E LB121 18.90 - 12 Tangle117§ Lady Sabrina117É Perfect World119§ Stdied 6-1/2,ease,van 10
28ä03= 7Hol fm 1² ê :51©1:16 1:40 2:04¨ 3ÎçAlw 43000N1X 62 5 1¦ 1Ç 1Ç 4§ 6¦¨Smith M E LB119 2.40 56= 23 Theater R. N.117¦õ Sonia121É Fly By Night119§ô Inside duel,weakened 6
8ä03= 3SA fm 1² ê :48§1:13¦ 1:36©2:00© 3ÎçÐCalCupDstH100k811010«õ10¤õ 9¦¥ 8¬õ 7«öDesormeaux K JLB117 21.20 82= 10 MoscowBrnng114§ô ArdmRlnch114ôVlntnDncr118§ Wide,angled in,no bid 10
4å03= 8SA fm 1° ê :48¦1:12© 1:36©1:48¨ 3ÎçOC 40k/N1X-N 86 3 1ô 1¦ô 1¦ 1ô 4¦öSmith M E LB117 6.70 84= 14 LadyAnnliese118ôSilverYen118¦ ArdumRelunch120É Inside,edged for 3d 12
8æ03= 7Dmr fm 1Â ê :24 :48 1:11¨1:41© 3ÎçÐOC 25k/N1X-N 83 4 1¦ 1ô 1¦ 1§ô 1§ôSmith M E LB116 3.20 92= 16 Susie Joe's116§ô Flying Heart123ô Lori M'love121Ç Inside,clear,driving 10

18Ý03= 6Dmr fst 6f :21© :45 :57¨1:11 3ÎçÐAlw 54000N1X 70 6 3 3¦ 1Ç 1ô 5¨õFlores D R LB117 5.30 83= 09 HollywoodHony119ö HrrcnRos123Ç RnRbccRn119¦ô Bid,led,wkened late 9
3Ý03= 1Dmr fst 6ôf :22¦ :45¦ 1:09©1:16§ 3ÎçÐAlw 52920N1X 75 2 3 3§ 3¦ô 2¦ô 2©ôFlores D R LB116 7.20 88= 14 DreamofSummer123©ô SusieJoes116ªô Looknsexy123§ô Rail trip,2nd best 4

20Þ03= 3Hol fst 1Â :22§ :45§ 1:09©1:43¨ 3ÎçÐAlw 51000N1X 36 3 2« 2® 4«ô 5¦¤ 5§®ôNakatani C SLB117 *.30e 56= 14TuckedAwy116¦ô TheCndiQueen119¦ AftrMyHrt119Ç Eased,crossed wire 5
29Ü03= 6Hol fst 7f :22¦ :45 1:09¦1:22 3ÎçÐAlw 48000N1X 71 5 4 5§õ 3¦ô 2§ô 4©Smith M E LB116 2.60 88= 05 SpiritRun116§TuckedAwy116ó WtermelonWine119§ 3wd into lane,no bid 9
24ß03= 3Hol fst 1Â :23 :47 1:11¨1:44¨ 3ÎçAlw 40000s82 4 1¦ 1¦ 1¦ 1§ô 1©Smith M E LB115 *.60 81= 19 Susie Joe's115© DarlingDemon114¦ CraftyMadness117§ Inside, ridden out 6
WORKS:ã 2SA 4f fst :53§ H29/30ä 26SA 4f fst :51© H36/38å 24SA 4f fst :48¨ H36/105å 13SA 5f fst :59¨ H3/34å 6SA 5f fst 1:00¨ H12/43æ29SA 5f fst 1:01¨ H19/30
TRAINER:1stClaim(93 .29 $2.05)Sprint/Route(26 .15 $1.65)31-60Days(167 .23 $1.68)Dirt(475 .24 $1.85)Routes(207 .14 $1.30)Claim(388 .23 $1.86)

2
White

My Honey Bunny
Own: Cheil Kruger Morrison Et Al
Dark Green, Silver Star, Green Cap

FLORES D R (109 17 13 14 .16) 2004: (837 122 .15)
$25,000

Ch. f. 4 (Apr)
Sire: Swiss Yodeler (Eastern Echo) $5,000
Dam:Martha My Dear (Regal and Royal)
Br: Marvin Malmuth (Cal)
Tr: Mayberry Summer(3 1 0 0 .33) 2004:(74 5 .07)

L 119

Life 30 5 5 5 $192,03485

2004 11 2 3 1 $71,244 85
2003 7 1 1 1 $37,884 79
Hol 11 2 2 4 $73,379 85

D.Fst 27 5 5 5 $189,474 85
Wet(405) 2 0 0 0 $2,560 57
Turf(222) 1 0 0 0 $0 70
Dst(317) 6 1 1 0 $32,152 85

10ä04= 1Hol fst 1Â :24§ :48¨ 1:13 1:44¨ 3ÎçClm 32000(32-28) 69 2 1¦ 1¦ 1Ç 3¦ 4ªôJauregui L HLB119 5.30 72= 20EmbrasseMoi119Ç DarlinCorey119¦ôFatalCaper119© Speed,inside,wkened 5
17å04= 2SA wf 1 :22 :45¦ 1:10¨1:38¨ 3ÎçClm 40000(40-35) - 6 5¨õ 5ªô 6¦« 6§© -Bisono Aª LB114 f 8.70 - 17 BriteSunnyDy119ô StonebridgeLdy119¦ LittleFoxyBby116© 4wd 7/8,eased 6
11æ04=10Fpx fst 1Â :22© :46§ 1:11¨1:44¦ 3ÎçOC c-40k/N1X 56 3 3¨ 3¦ô 4© 5¤ô 5¦«öPedroza M ALB119 2.70 71= 11 Awesome Lady114ö Noyac117® Clickety Cat123© Drifted,stdied early 6

Claimed from Valente Roddy J. for $40,000, Spawr Bill Trainer 2004(as of 9/11): ( 214 51 43 25 0.24 )
23Û04= 3Dmr fst 1 :23¦ :47¨ 1:13 1:39 3ÎçClm c-(32-28) 74 6 2¦ô 2Ç 2Ç 1ô 2ôEspinoza V LB119 f 4.70 78= 21 WtrmlonWin119ô MyHonyBunny119¦ ClicktyCt119¨ Vied,led,fought back 8

Claimed from Alesia, Bran Jam Stable, Westerlund, et al for $32,000, Eurton Peter Trainer 2004(as of 7/23): ( 66 9 12 7 0.14 )
13Þ04= 2Hol fst 1Â :22© :45§ 1:10©1:45¨ 4ÎçClm c-(40-35) 68 1 1ô 1Ç 1¦ô 2ô 2öValdivia J Jr LB118 f 2.10 72= 19 ThBorgQun118ö MyHonyBunny118¬ BllNunzi120ô Fought back rail,game 5

Claimed from Steinmann Heinz for $40,000, Harrington Mike Trainer 2004(as of 6/13): ( 76 13 6 14 0.17 )
21Ü04= 7Hol fm 1 ê :23§ :46¨ 1:10©1:35 4ÎçClm 50000(50-45) 70 7 2¦ô 2© 2¦ô 4¨ 6¬Valdivia J Jr LB118 f 11.90 82= 12 Phaedr118óSweetFrippery120§ MrketGrden113§ Stalked pace, weakened 9
29ß04= 5Hol fst 1Â :23¨ :47 1:11 1:42¦ 4ÎçClm 32000(32-28) 85 2 1¦ 1¦ 1¦ô 1¦ô 1óBisono A¬ LB113 f 4.70 90= 10 MyHonyBnny113ó ClcktyCt122¤ Sorrytotlly116¦õ Gamely staved off foe 6
20à04= 4SA fst 1 :23§ :47¦ 1:11©1:37© 4ÎçOC 50k/N1X 72 3 1¦ô 1ô 1Ç 5§ô 5®Bisono A¬ LB111 f 11.50 73= 18 Seattle Queen118§ Golden K K113Ç Ela Ela118§ Dueled, rail, weakened 6
19á04= 1SA fst 1 :22 :45© 1:11 1:38§ çClm 32000(32-28) 81 4 2§ 2¦ 1Ç 1¦ 1öBisono A¬ LB110 f 5.90 79= 20 My Honey Bunny110ö Nellie L117¦ Tender Trap117¦ô Bid,led,clear,held 6
5á04= 5SA fst 6f :21© :45¦ :57§1:10§ çClm 32000(32-28) 79 2 2 3¦ô 2¦ 2§ 3§ôBisono A¬ LB110 f 5.50 83= 13 Memogrm117§ô Hgerstown117óMyHonyBunny110ª Came out 1/8,lost 2nd 5

14â04= 2SA fst 5ôf :21¨ :44¨ :57 1:03¨ çClm 40000(40-35) 75 1 4 3¨ 3¨ô 2¨ô 2©Bisono A¬ LB110 f 3.90 90= 11 MngoEscpd117© MyHnyBnny110¨ AdsMdwlk118¨ Came out turn,2nd best 6
14ã03= 3Hol fst 6f :21¨ :44§ :57 1:10¦ 3ÎçOC 40k/N1X 76 6 1 3© 3§ô 3§ 4¦öEspinoza V LB121 f 14.50 87= 10 Secret Caper117Ç Mi d'Or119¦ô Forest Native121Ç Bit wide into lane 6
WORKS:ã 11SA 3f fst :34© H2/28ã 2SA 4f fst :48§ H8/30ä 3SA 5f fst 1:00¨ H14/19å 26SA 4f fst 1:00¨ H25/25å 12SA 4f fst :48© H18/37å 2SA 5f fst 1:01 H15/40
TRAINER:31-60Days(43 .05 $0.27)Dirt(123 .07 $1.11)Routes(49 .08 $0.81)Claim(39 .08 $0.36)

3
Blue

West Coast Gee Gee
Own: Batchelor Family Trust McClintock or
Brown, White Circle "Jb" On Back, Orange

BAZE T C (155 28 18 19 .18) 2004: (1335 225 .17)
$22,500

Dk. b or br f. 4 (Feb) BARMAR02 $90,000
Sire: Bertrando (Skywalker) $12,500
Dam:Gene's Grinders (Ormonte)
Br: Jose Carro (Cal)
Tr: Becerra Rafael(24 4 1 5 .17) 2004:(247 35 .14)

Blinkers ON

L 117

Life 12 2 1 0 $56,19886

2004 2 0 0 0 $700 62
2003 9 2 1 0 $55,498 86
Hol 1 0 0 0 $0 53

D.Fst 4 1 0 0 $13,800 62
Wet(394) 1 0 0 0 $300 49
Turf(320) 7 1 1 0 $42,098 86
Dst(412) 0 0 0 0 $0 -

21ä04= 7Hol fm 5ôf ê :22 :45¦ :57¦1:03§ 3ÎçClm 40000(40-35) 62 3 4 3É 4§õ 7¨õ 11¬ôFigueroa O LB119 f 15.00 81= 10 Spiritd117¦ô ExclusivDposit121¦ô BurnishdStl123ó Inside duel,weakened 11
20å04= 7BM wf 5f ï :21¨ :44§ :56© 3ÎçClm 32000(32-30) 49 5 5 7¤ 6«õ 8¦¥ 8¦¦öPerez M A LB116 fb 19.10 88= 14Unforgtbull118¨ AmricnAnthm116É OfftothOpr116¦ô Svd grnd to no avail 8

11Ý03= 6Dmr fm 5f ê :21§ :44¨ :56¦ 3ÎçAlw 63720N1X 60 1 3 3§ 5© 8¬õ 8®ôValenzuela P ALB117 b 3.70 - - ThPrtisOvr123¦ GoodbyGmblr119¦ô PlsDrPls119¦ô Inside,fell back,wkend 8
16Û03= 7Hol fm 1 ê :24 :47§ 1:11¦1:35¨ çOC 80k/N1X-N 72 4 1Ç 1Ç 1Ç 2ô 4«Baze T C LB118 b 2.00 80= 19 No Kings120ô Shezsospiritual118¦ô DesertView120© Pulled,inside,wkened 4
25Ü03= 4Hol fm 5ôf ê :22¦ :45¦ :57¦1:03¦ çClm c-(62.5-55) 82 5 1 2§ 2¦ô 2ô 2¦ôBaze T C LB118 b *1.80 86= 12 AmrcnAnthm118¦ô WstCstGG118§ô MrgrtsFncy117¦ Led past 1/8,caught 8

Claimed from Jaime Royce for $62,500, O'Neill Doug Trainer 2003(as of 5/25): ( 235 46 31 33 0.20 )
16Ü03= 3Hol fm 1 ê :23¨ :46© 1:10¨1:35§ 3ÎçÐAlw 51000N1X 86 1 1§ô 1¦ô 1¦ 1¦ 5¦öBaze T C LB113 b 5.10 85= 11 Surprisingly119¦LuckySpirit119ô ShrdthExcss119Ç Inside, weakened late 8
25ß03= 2Hol fm 5ôf ê :21© :44§ :56©1:03¦ çClm 45000(50-45) 81 5 2 1¦ 1¦ô 1§ 1¦Baze T C LB114 b 11.40 88= 09 WstCstGG114¦ AkrnAvn118É Orwhstlbrtchs118¦ô Speed,angled in,game 8
10ß03= 5SA fm 1 ê :22¦ :45§ 1:09¨1:34© çClm 45000(50-45) 73 2 2§ 2§ô 2¨ 3¨ 5¨Baze T C LB112 17.80 85= 12 ProvenForm116§ LCmpnll116É ArtistsStudio116ô Stalked rail,outkicked 8
8à03= 7SA fst 6ôf :22 :45 1:10©1:17© çAlw 40000s27 1 5 6¦ 8ªö 9¦¦ 9§§õValenzuela P ALB120 5.30 62= 13 Thrlfrmstrd120¨NncsMcBrsh120©ô LttlMsGnrl118§ô Tight 3-1/2,gave way 9
9á03= 9SA fst 6f :22 :45§ :58§1:11¨ çÐMd 40000(40-35) 62 6 7 3ô 2¦ 1Ç 1¨ôBaze T C LB120 2.50 80= 12 WestCostGeeG120¨ô ShnnonKy120¦JustbyChnc120¦ 3wd to turn,led,clear 12

25â03= 7SA fst 6ôf :21§ :44© 1:11§1:18¦ çÐMd Sp Wt 48k3310 1 2Ç 3ô 7«ö 10¦©Espinoza V LB120 b 6.00 68= 07 Small Town Girl120¦ Souvenir Party120§ô Erin120¦ 4wd,3wd,weakened 13
26Þ02= 3Hol fst 5f :21© :46 :58© çÐMd Sp Wt 43k53 7 2 2Ç 2Ç 4§ 6¬ôValenzuela P ALB119 *1.00 80= 14 AmberHills119¦ô BartoksBlithe119§VlentineDncer119¦ Dueled, weakened 8
WORKS: òä 14Hol4f fst :47§ H1/33òä 6Hol4f fst :46§ H1/45å 14SA 4f fst :49¦ B22/37å 4SA 5f fst 1:02¦ H30/49æ22SA 6f fst 1:13 H6/24
TRAINER:Turf/Dirt(37 .16 $1.54)BlinkOn(21 .10 $1.27)Sprint/Route(48 .15 $1.79)Dirt(365 .18 $1.59)Routes(220 .17 $1.57)Claim(189 .20 $1.72)
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4
Yellow

Funny Bone
Own: Beardsworth or Decauwer or Lurie
Dark Green, Black Diamond On Back, White

GOMEZ G K (83 10 16 15 .12) 2004: (209 29 .14)
$25,000

Dk. b or br m. 6 (Apr)
Sire: Strike Gold (Mr. Prospector) $2,500
Dam:Funny Reality (Cutlass Reality)
Br: John J Zamora & Linda Lee Zamora (Cal)
Tr: Stute Gary(13 1 3 1 .08) 2004:(101 14 .14)

L 119

Life 4610 6 3 $193,09081

2004 12 1 1 1 $30,375 79
2003 9 2 0 1 $40,950 81
Hol 1 1 0 0 $12,000 75

D.Fst 26 6 2 1 $86,517 81
Wet(388) 4 1 1 1 $35,675 76
Turf(220) 16 3 3 1 $70,898 81
Dst(336) 3 1 0 1 $19,450 81

26ä04= 4Hol fst 6f :22§ :45¨ :57©1:10 3ÎçClm 20000(20-18) 75 1 4 4§ 3¦ô 3É 1§Gomez G K LB119 4.50 87= 11 FunnyBone119§ DaSvedonya117ó ConcealtheDeal117¨ 3wd bid lane,clear 6
14æ04= 7Fpx fst 6f :22¨ :46 :58§1:10© 3ÎçClm 20000(20-18) 67 6 4 5ª 5¨ô 5©ô 4ªõBerrio O A LB119 f 4.20 88= 13 GranjaVivo119¦õ RedNeckLdy119¦ô CozyLegend114§ô Angled in, no rally 7
5æ04= 5Dmr fst 1 :22¦ :46 1:11 1:37¨ 3ÎçÐOC 25k/N1X 47 6 5¨ö 6© 6¬ 8¦¦ 8¦¤ôBerrio O A LB123 b 34.70 67= 07 Free China119¦ô Frysland119§ Madam General123© 3 wide 1/2, no rally 9

23Ý04= 6Dmr fst 6ôf :22¨ :45¨ 1:11 1:17¨ 3ÎçÐOC 40k/N1X 58 6 2 4¦ô 4¦ô 7¬õ 6¤õGarcia M S LB123 b 8.80 79= 21 TizRoylty121ô MdmGenrl123É WhyKnottMToo121ô 4wd,5wd,bid,wkened 7
11Ý04= 3Dmr fst 1Â :23 :46¦ 1:10¨1:45¨ 3ÎçOC 40k/N1X 61 4 3§ 3¨ 3ª 3« 3«Garcia M S LB121 5.40 74= 18Beucette121¨ RnfortheDough121¨ FunnyBone121É Came out str,held 3rd 5
28Û04= 4Dmr fst 6f :22¦ :45 :57¦1:10¦ 3ÎçClm c-(25-22.5) 65 8 2 8¬õ 8¤ 6¬õ 2¤Ruis Mª LB114 18.20 80= 14 ZmZm114¤ FunnyBone114§ BertrndosModel119É Wide,angled in,2d best 8

Claimed from Zamora, John J. and Linda for $25,000, Wilmot William B Trainer 2004(as of 7/28): ( 17 0 0 2 0.00 )
9Û04= 5Hol fm 5ôf ê :21© :45§ :57©1:04 4ÎçClm 40000(40-35) 72 1 5 2¦ 2¦ 3¦ô 6©Enriquez I D LB118 b 20.40 81= 15 CarlaRose120ô BallisticAngel118ô ShyPatad113¦ Bid btwn,stalked,wkend 7

18Þ04= 5Hol fm 5ôf ê :21¨ :45 :57§1:03¨ 4ÎçClm 35000(40-35) 79 4 6 6©ô 6¨õ 6© 5§ôEnriquez I D LB117 b 26.60 84= 13 LdyGnrl112ô BrockysDrm118¦ SpinningAtDwn118ô Off rail turn,outkickd 7
10ß04= 9SA fst 6f :21© :45 :57 1:09© 4ÎçClm 32000(32-28) 58 3 6 6ª 7¬ô 8¤ 7¦¨Martinez F FLB118 b 23.70 76= 12 Moyanna118§ô Reatta Pass118© Magic Smoke118§ô 3wd to turn,no bid 8
12à04= 5GG fst 6f :22¦ :45 :57§1:09© 4ÎçClm 25000(25-22.5) 67 3 4 4« 4© 4© 4ªAlvarado F TLB116 b 2.40 83= 14Clever Coed116§ô Radon116§ô Dream Boldly115ó Lacked needed rally 4
13á04= 5SA fst 6ôf :21© :44© 1:09©1:16¦ 4ÎçClm 45000(50-45) 67 6 4 3É 1Ç 4¦õ 6®ôMartinez F FLB115 b 36.80 81= 13 ThrmlAblsion119¦ôChosnHonor119ªAlpnSngr118§ Dueled btwn,weakened 8
24â04= 8SA fm Í6ôf ê :22 :44¦ 1:07¨1:13© 4ÎçClm 4000070 2 9 9ªö 9«õ 7« 7¨öSterling L J JrLB119 b 10.10 84= 12 It's Stevie's Time119¦ Kouri Jill118Ç Carla Rose118ó Bit off rail,no bid 10
WORKS:ã 3SA 4f fst :47¦ H3/43òä 23SA 4f fst :46§ H1/45ä 16SA 4f fst :47¨ H9/36ä 10SA 6f fst 1:12 H3/11ä 5SA 5f fst :59© H7/43å 31SA 4f fst :48§ H11/89
TRAINER:2Off45-180(7 .00 $0.00)Sprint/Route(24 .21 $2.82)2Sprints/Route(3 .00 $0.00)WonLastStart(26 .19 $2.99)Dirt(174 .16 $2.12)Routes(55 .18 $2.22)

5
Green

Fatal Caper
Own: James W or Marcia S Equils
Teal, White 'Jem' On Navy Oval Emblem On

BERRIO O A (22 1 5 5 .05) 2004: (238 13 .05)
$25,000

Dk. b or br f. 4 (Mar)
Sire: Town Caper (Fatih) $2,500
Dam:Ah Fatal*Arg (Ahmad*Arg)
Br: Haras El Palenque & Earl McNeil (Cal)
Tr: Knapp Steve(60 3 8 11 .05) 2004:(412 46 .11)

L 123

Life 24 8 2 6 $163,63681

2004 14 6 2 2 $91,394 80
2003 7 1 0 3 $56,642 81
Hol 10 5 1 3 $92,520 79

D.Fst 19 7 2 5 $135,362 79
Wet(468) 1 1 0 0 $20,880 76
Turf(248) 4 0 0 1 $7,394 81
Dst(313) 12 6 2 3 $115,240 79

10ä04= 1Hol fst 1Â :24§ :48¨ 1:13 1:44¨ 3ÎçClm 32000(32-28) 76 5 5ª 5ªô 5©õ 4¨ 3¦ôBerrio O A LB119 2.10 76= 20EmbrasseMoi119Ç DarlinCorey119¦ô FatalCper119© 3wd into str,best rest 5
9å04= 8SA fst 1Â :22© :46¨ 1:11§1:45¦ 3ÎçClm 25000(25-22.5) 76 7 9¦¥ 9¦§ 8¤õ 3© 1«Berrio O A LB119 8.30 79= 16 FtlCper119« StonebridgeLdy119¦ ThrillAfterDrk119§ô 5wd into lane,clear 10

20Ý04= 3Dmr fst 1Â :23¦ :47§ 1:13¦1:46 3ÎçClm c-(16-14) 69 6 5®ö 6¬ô 6© 2¦ô 1¦Berrio O A LB121 4.00 78= 17Fatal Caper121¦Buttertart119ªô Lori M'love114© Rail rally,gamely 6
Claimed from Haras El Palenque and McNeil, Earl for $16,000, Avila A C Trainer 2004(as of 8/20): ( 124 7 13 13 0.06 )

30Þ04= 1Hol fst 1Â :23© :47¨ 1:12¦1:44¨ 3ÎçClm c-(12.5-10.5) 69 4 4©ô 4ªô 3¨ô 2§ 2©ôBerrio O A LB123 1.20 73= 22 ChrliesGoodGirl119©ôFtlCpr123¬ LdyContinntl121¬ Inside move,2nd best 4
Claimed from Haras El Palenque and McNeil, Earl for $12,500, Avila A C Trainer 2004(as of 6/30): ( 94 5 9 9 0.05 )

9Þ04= 2Hol fst 1Â :23¨ :47¦ 1:12¨1:44© 4ÎçClm 16000(16-14) 73 6 6«ö 6«ô 6¦ö 1ô 1¨Sorenson D LB120 *1.10 77= 23 Fatal Caper120¨ Danmark118ª Nichole's Delight113¦ô Stdied 5/16,5wd bid 6
19Ü04= 1Hol fst 1Â :23§ :47¦ 1:12§1:45¦ 4ÎçClm 12500(12.5-10.5) 68 6 6¬ 6« 5© 3§ 1öSorenson D LB120 3.30 75= 22Fatal Caper120ö Ruby Choise118ªô La Bella118¨ Rallied,wore down foe 6
2Ü04= 2Hol fst 1Â :24 :47© 1:12¦1:44 4ÎçClm 14000(16-14) 68 2 6©õ 6©õ 6©ô 2ô 1§Berrio O A LB116 4.40 81= 18FatalCper116§ DoubleQuck118¨ WhirlwindTrip118¨ Rail rally, edged away 6

21ß04= 1Hol fst 1Â :23¨ :47§ 1:12¦1:45¦ 4ÎçClm 10000(10-9) 68 3 4ªô 3ª 3© 2¦ô 1öBerrio O A LB118 2.40 75= 19FtlCper118ö SkysComet118¬ô FncyBegining118ô Came out,wore down foe 6
9ß04= 2SA fst 1Â :22¨ :46© 1:12 1:44© çClm 14000(16-14) 63 3 6¦§ 6®ô 6« 5¨õ 2¦õBerrio O A LB116 7.50 80= 13 Arch Ability117¦õFatal Caper116Ç Missle Do118ô Late for 2nd outside 7

18à04= 3SA fst 1 :24¦ :48© 1:13¨1:40 4ÎçClm 12500(12.5-10.5) 54 1 3§ 4§ô 5©ô 6ªô 6«öBerrio O A LB118 2.40 64= 29 Lettertotheeditor118ö Sky's Comet118¨ MissleDo116¦ Rail trip, no threat 7
28á04= 7SA fst 1Â :23¨ :48 1:13¦1:46¦ çClm 20000(20-18) 69 4 6ªö 6ªö 6¨ö 3¨ 3¦ôBerrio O A LB117 7.50 72= 21 ShellysTerms117ô Myofficewife117¦ FatalCper117ªô Came out str,rallied 7
11á04= 5SA fm 1 ê :23§ :47§ 1:11§1:36¨ 4ÎçÐOC 40k/N1X-N 61 6 8ªö 8® 7® 7¬ô 7¤õBerrio O A LB117 15.00 71= 14DeputyTombe119ö ProudNicole119§ElctricChir117¨ Saved ground, no rally 8
WORKS:ã 13SA 3f fst :36© H14/32ä 1SA 5f fst 1:01§ H37/65æ26SA 5f fst :59© H13/55æ17SA 4f fst :52¦ H43/44
TRAINER:31-60Days(110 .15 $2.06)Dirt(589 .12 $1.53)Routes(171 .08 $0.84)Claim(388 .11 $1.30)

6
Black

Musical Review
Own: Alfred G Brazil
Kelly Green, Yellow "Brs" On Back, Green

MARTINEZ F F (110 14 12 12 .13) 2004: (663 52 .08)
$22,500

B. m. 5 (Apr)
Sire: Vaudeville (Theatrical*Ire) $1,000
Dam:Montibel (Bel Bolide)
Br: A G Brazil (Cal)
Tr: Jory Ian P D(17 2 3 3 .12) 2004:(160 14 .09)

L 117

Life 8 2 1 0 $35,04077

2004 1 0 0 0 $0 76
2003 7 2 1 0 $35,040 77
Hol 2 1 0 0 $9,000 68

D.Fst 2 1 0 0 $9,000 68
Wet(310) 0 0 0 0 $0 -
Turf(312) 6 1 1 0 $26,040 77
Dst(279) 1 1 0 0 $9,000 68

15â04= 5SA fm 1 ê :23¦ :47¦ 1:11¦1:35¦ 4ÎçÐOC 40k/N1X-N 76 2 5©ô 6©ô 7©ô 6©ö 6¨Martinez F FLB121 21.30 83= 14 Thermosttic121ö ChinPrincess117¦ StrWizrd119É Steadied 3/4,outkicked 8
18ã03= 5Hol fm 1Â ê :24¨ :48© 1:13 1:44¦ 3ÎçAlw 40000s77 1 4§ô 5§õ 4§ô 3§ô 1ÇMartinez F FLB123 5.60 75= 25 Musical Review123Ç Docket118¦ Arch Ability120ô Split foes5/16,rallied 6
14ä03= 2Hol fst 1Â :24 :48 1:12§1:44¨ 3ÎçMd 25000(25-22.5) 68 6 4§ô 3¦ô 2§ô 2§ô 1öMartinez F FLB123 *2.30 81= 13Musical Review123öNellie L120« Zee Topper120© Pulled,wore down foe 7
17å03= 6SA fm 1 ê :22 :45§ 1:09¦1:33¨ 3ÎçÐMd Sp Wt 50k62 1 7¦§ 7¦¥ 7®ô 7¦¥ 7®ôBaze T C LB122 7.50 84= 06Jazz Ya119¨ Ashley's Folly119ÇSunny Outcome119ô Inside trip,no rally 9
8æ03= 4Dmr fm 1 ê :22¦ :45© 1:10§1:35© 3ÎÐMd Sp Wt 56k73 5 6«ô 6ªô 5©ô 7¨õ 7¨Enriquez I D LB120 20.70 81= 16 NewWter115óBlirsGenerl118É Excellentchrcter123¦ Saved ground to 1/4 9

13Ý03= 3Dmr fm 1Â ê :24 :48¦ 1:11©1:42¨ 3ÎçÐMd Sp Wt 56k62 9 7« 8«õ 8¤ö 8® 7¬Krone J A LB123 3.50 81= 07 Flying Heart123¦ Liberty Lady118ÇNew Water118§ô 3wd 1st turn,no rally 9
10Û03= 8Hol fm 1Â ê :23¨ :47¦ 1:11¨1:43¨ 3ÎçÐMd Sp Wt 51k69 2 8®ö 8®õ 8«ö 6ªõ 2¦Krone J A LB123 7.70 77= 14 BonnieBrighton116¦ MusiclRviw123¦ô ScorSix117ó Washy,3wd into lane 12
18Ü03= 6Hol fst 6f :21© :44¦ :57§1:10© 3ÎçÐMd Sp Wt 44k49 4 12 11¦© 7¦ª 7¤ö 6¬öMartinez F FLB123 73.20 78= 10 Plus Three117¨Looknsexy123Ç Blushing Bull117¦ Off bit slow 12
WORKS:ã 11Hol4f fst :47¦ H4/46ä 30Hol6f fst 1:15© H14/14ä 24Hol6f fst 1:15 H5/11ä 18Hol6f fst 1:14§ H5/16ä 12Hol5f fst 1:01© H18/37ä 6Hol4f fst :47© H9/45
TRAINER:+180Days(19 .05 $0.26)Turf/Dirt(41 .10 $1.53)Dirt(209 .09 $1.29)Routes(199 .08 $1.23)Claim(59 .08 $1.69)
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